INVITATION TO BID BID DUE DATE AND TIME

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF LSL) 05/21/2024 1100 AM  CT

AND AGRICULTURAL & MECHANICAL COLLEGE

SOLICITATION RFQ-0000002223 RETURN BID TO
SUPPLIER # Isubids@lsu.edu
SUPPLIER NAME AND ADDRESS

Buyer Erica Pino
Buyer Phone

Buyer Email epino2@lsu.edu
Issue Date  05/03/2024

TITLE: Sewer Cleaning Service - Term Contract

Addendum 01: Natice is given to all parties that this Solicitation is amended by the University as stated herein. This
Addendum is hereby made an official part of this solicitation. See attached Supplier Inquiry and Response.

bR

To Be Completed By Supplier
"No Bid" (sign and return this page only).
My Company does not wish to receive future solicitations for this spend category.
Specify your Delivery: To be made within days after receipt of order.

If applicable, Supplier's Addendum Acknowledgement/Response:
As an authorized agent/signatory of the supplier, I/'we acknowledge receipt of this Addendum, and
submit no alterations/clarifications to our original bid.

submit superseding revisions/clarifications to our original bid as written herein or attached hereto.

General Instructions to Suppliers

Sealed bids for furnishing the items and/or services specified are hereby solicited, and will be received by LSU Procurement at
the "Return Bid To" address stated above, until the specified due date and time.

Read the entire solicitation, including all terms, conditions and specifications.

All bid information and prices must be typed or written in ink. Any corrections, erasures or other forms of alteration to unit price
are to be initialed by the supplier.

Bid prices are to be quoted FOB LSU/Destination and inclusive of any and all applicable shipping and handling charges unless
otherwise specified in the solicitation. Any invoiced delivery charges not quoted and itemized on the LSU purchase order are
subject to rejection and non-payment.

Payment is to be made within 30 days after receipt of properly executed invoice, or delivery and acceptance, whichever is
later.

By signing this solicitation, the supplier certifies compliance with all general instructions to suppliers, terms, conditions and
specifications; and further certifies that this bid is made without collusion or fraud.

SUPPLIER NAME

MAILING ADDRESS

IAUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

CITY, STATE ZIP

PRINTED NAME PHONE #
TITLE FAX #
E-MAIL FEDERAL TAX ID #

LSU IS AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY/ACCESS UNIVERSITY

Rev. 5/18




Solicitation 0000002223

Addendum 01

Supplier Inquiry and Response

Q1. | have a question in regards to line item #1. What does the supplemental labor support entail? Is that
for plumbing or drain cleaning or in general?

Al. The support would be to cover a few different aspects - underground sewer piping as well as in
buildings, handling toilet and sewer stop ups, clear lines, run jet machine, etc. Also support in DIN calls,
toilet issues, leaking faucets, etc.

Q2. Can you please send me the itemized bid tabulation from the last time this contact was procured?

A2. See attached itemized bid tabulations.



Response Tabulation - By Item v i

RFQ Nbr: RFQ-0000001393 - Sewer Cleaning Service - Term Contract RFQ Type: Invitation to Bid

Response Line Summary im

Click a line below to view line details

[ Line 1 - Sewer Pumping Station and Grease Interceptor Cleaning - ]

Sewer Pumping Station and Grease Interceptor Cleaning

Awa Response Nir - Supplier Respom Respons Respons  Respons
Status Mame Company Dese a4 QTY o UCH Unit Co: Tot
Y FEval.. 1-BATON ROUGE Louisiana State University 300.00 Hour $308.00 $92,400.

SEWER & DRAIN INC - and Agricultural and o

Roto Rooter (SPL-00698)  Mechanical College (10}

2 - Master Vac Industrial ~ Louisiana State University  300.00 Hour
Services LLC (SPL-00847) and Agricuitural and

Machanical College (10)
[TE Pagei—ﬂ v

N Eval. $315.00 $94,3500.
ao

Sourcing Buyer: Alexandra Garcia

Line Type

No Bid

Line Number
Supplier

Item Description
Spend Category
Quantity

Unit Of Measure
Unit Cost
Amount

Target Price
Due Date

Price Required

Lead Time
Required

Evaluation Type

Memo

Welcome,

Evaluation Type: Group  Responses: 2 Awards: 1

Response Line Information

Goods Line

No

1

BATON ROUGE SEWER & DRAIN INC - Roto Rooter (SPL-00698)
Sewer Pumping Statton and Grease Interceptor Cleaning
Maintenance - Land, Building, Structures {(SC0009})

300.00

Hour

£308.0000

$92,400.00

No
Mo

ET_Al_Or_None

%
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RFQ SUMMARY RESPONSE ENTRY  TAB - ALL OR NONE TAB - BY GROUP  TAB - BY ITEM

;A Nl i

Response Tabulation - By Item el
RFQ Nbr: RFQ-0000001393 - Sewer Cleaning Service - Term Contract ~ RFQ Type: Invitation to Bid

Response Line Summary

Click a line below to view line details

i Line

Disposal Cost for Septic Material Removed Associated with Pumping

Awn Status Response Nbr - Supplier o A Respon: Respons Respons Respons
d TS Name b e il e QTY e UOM Unit Cos Tot:
Y Eval.. 1-BATON ROUGE Louisiana State University  5,000. Gallon $0.65 $3,250.0

SEWER & DRAIN INC -
Roto Rooter (SPL-00698)

and Agricultural and 00 0
Mechanical College (10)

N Eval.. 2 - Master Vac Industrial Louisiana State University  5,000. Gallon $0.65 $3,250.0
Services LLC (SPL-00847) and Agricultural and 00 0
Mechanical College (10)
Page

Provide Website Feedback

- Disposal Cost f.c;r_-S-ééi‘i“cmMéterialrRemoved'Associated wifhﬂ Pu ]

AWARD SUMMARY

RESPONSE TABULATION

Sourcing Buyer: Alexandra Garcia

Welcome, St

Evaluation Type: Group Responses: 2 Awards: 1

Response Line Information

Line Type

No Bid

Line Number
Supplier

Item Description
Spend Category
Quantity

Unit Of Measure
Unit Cost
Amount

Target Price
Due Date

Price Required

Lead Time
Required

Evaluation Type

Memo

Goods Line

No

2

BATON ROUGE SEWER & DRAIN INC - Roto Rooter (SPL-00698)
Disposal Cost for Septic Material Removed Associated with Pumping
Maintenance - Land, Building, Structures (SC0009)

5,000.00

Gallon

$0.6500

$3,250.00

No
No

ET_All_Or_None

L5 | Procure

67% &
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RFQ SUMMARY RESPONSE ENTRY  TAB- ALLOR NONE TAB-BY GROUP  TAB-BY ITEM  AWARD SUMMARY
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Response Tabulation - By Item
RFQ Nbr: RFQ-0000001393 - Sewer Cleaning Service - Term Contract RFQ Type: Invitation to Bid

Response Line Summary B

Click a line below to view line details

| Line 3 - High Velocity Sewer Line Cleaning v | Line Type

High Velocity Sewer Line Cleaning No Bid

Awa Seattis Response Nbr - Supplier Company Desc Respon: Respons Respons Respons Line Number
g Status  ome Company Desc e QTY e UOM Unit Cos Toti
e : Supplier
Y Eval.. 1-BATON ROUGE Louisiana State University  15.00 Hour $170.00 $2,550.0
SEWER & DRAIN INC - and Agricultural and 0 Item Description
Roto Rooter (SPL-00698)  Mechanical College (10)
N Eval.. 2- Master Vac Industrial  Louisiana State University  15.00 Hour $175.00 $2,625.0 Spend Category
Services LLC (SPL-00847) and Agricultural and 0 uanti
Mechanical College (10) Spaatiny
page Unit Of Measure
Unit Cost
Amount
Target Price
Due Date

Price Required

Lead Time
Required

Evaluation Type

Memo

Provide Website Feedback

RESPONSE TABULATION

Sourcing Buyer: Alexandra Garcia

Welcoi

Evaluation Type: Group Responses: 2  Awards:

Response Line Information

Goods Line

No

3

BATON ROUGE SEWER & DRAIN INC - Roto Rooter (SPL-00698)
High Velocity Sewer Line Cleaning

Maintenance - Land, Building, Structures (SC0009)

15.00

Hour

$170.0000

$2,550.00

No

No

ET_All_Or_None

LSl P
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RFQ SUMMARY  RESPONSE ENTRY  TAB-ALLORNONE TAB-BYGROUP  TAB-BYITEM  AWARD SUMMARY
RESPONSE TABULATION

Response Tabulation - By Item Welcor

RFQ Nbr: RFQ-0000001393 - Sewer Cleaning Service - Term Contract ~ RFQ Type: Invitation to Bid Sourcing Buyer: Alexandra Garcia Evaluation Type: Group  Responses: 2 Awards:

Response Line Summary ~  Response Line Information

Click a line below to view line details

! Line G V;deolpect on M= Line Type Goods Line
Video Inspection : No Bid No
A-.:.;;-. Status i;n;-:—onu Nbr - Supplier Company Desc R:‘hn-;:;\ i{z{;(;;;lnl le-':;;:cg:; F'Qc'szx)i‘l:i Line Number 4
) . e Supplier BATON ROUGE SEWER & DRAIN INC - Roto Rooter (SPL-00698)
N Eval.. 2 -Master Vac Industrial Louisiana State University  10.00 Hour $230.00 $2,300.0
Services LLC (SPL-00847) and Agricultural and 0 Item Description Video Inspection
Mechanical College (10) ) o
Y Eval. 1-BATON ROUGE Louisiana State University ~ 10.00 Hour  $245.00 $2,450.0 Spund Catagory:  Malntenance Lund; Ealding, Steushyes (SC000%)
SEWER & DRAIN INC - and Agricultural and 0 Quantity 10.00

Roto Rooter (SPL-00698) Mechanical College (10)
Unit Of Measure  Hour

Page

Unit Cost $245.0000
Amount $2,450.00

Target Price

Due Date
Price Required No
Lead Time No
Required

Evaluation Type ET_All_Or_None

Memo

Provide Website Feedback LSL)IP




line 5.png

TAB - BY GROUP AWARD SUMMARY

RESPONSE ENTRY  TAB - ALL OR NONE

RFQ SUMMARY TAB - BY ITEM

R BT S g PSS

Response Tabulation - By Item

RFQ Nbr: RFQ-0000001393 - Sewer Cleaning Service - Term Contract ~ RFQ Type: Invitation to Bid

Response Line Summary ~
Click a line below to view line details
[Line 5 - Drain Cleaning = Line Type
No Bid

Drain Cleaning

Aw: Status Esi::‘lcn';o Nbr - Supplier Company Dese R\E];JT«::: ﬁgiiium— ‘T:_':np(:j: RES;)?:::’; Line Number
: . : Supplier
N Eval.. 2 -Master Vac Industrial Louisiana State University 120.00 Hour $145.00 $17,400.
Services LLC (SPL-00847) and Agricultural and 00 Item Description
Mechanical College (10)
Y Eval. 1-BATON ROUGE Louisiana State University 120.00 Hour $147.00 $17,640. Spont Catagory
SEWER & DRAIN INC - and Agricultural and 00 Quantity
Roto Rooter (SPL-00698) Mechanical College (10)
page ) 3 Unit Of Measure

Unit Cost
Amount
Target Price
Due Date
Price Required

Lead Time
Required

Evaluation Type

Memo

p=~vide Website Feedback

avasrrint:

RESPONSE TABULATION

Sourcing Buyer: Alexandra Garcia

Welc

Evaluation Type: Group Responses: 2  Award

Response Line Information

Goods Line

No

5

BATON ROUGE SEWER & DRAIN INC - Roto Rooter (SPL-006¢
Drain Cleaning

Maintenance - Land, Building, Structures (SC0009)

120.00

Hour

$147.0000

$17,640.00

No
No

ET_All_Or_None



RFQ SUMMARY RESPONSE ENTRY TAB - ALL OR NONE

Response Tabulation - By Item
RFQ Nbr: RFQ-0000001393 - Sewer Cleaning Service - Term Contract

Response Line Summary

Click a line below to view line details

TAB - BY GROUP

RFQ Type: Invitation to Bid

ke ®©

TAB - BY ITEM

P GI Y RS —

| Line 6 - Disposal Cost for Grease Removal Associated with Pumping -]

Disposal Cost for Grease Removal Associated with Pumping

Aw: Status ﬁ:::a"om;e Near - Suppller Company Desc Rﬂgﬁr‘t‘
Y Eval.. 1-BATON ROUGE Louisiana State University 180,00
SEWER & DRAIN INC - and Agricultural and 0.00

Roto Rooter (SPL-00698) Mechanical College (10)
N Eval.. 2 - Master Vac Industrial Louisiana State University 180,00
Services LLC (SPL-00847) and Agricultural and 0.00

Mechanical College (10)

Page

Provide Website Feedback

Respons Respons Respons
UoMm Unit Cos Tot:
Gallon $0.49 $88,200.

00
Gallon $0.50 $90,000.

00

AWARD SUMMARY

RESPONSE TABULATION

Sourcing Buyer: Alexandra Garcia

Welco

Evaluation Type: Group  Responses: 2  Awards

Response Line Information

Line Type

No Bid

Line Number
Supplier

Item Description
Spend Category
Quantity

Unit Of Measure
Unit Cost
Amount

Target Price
Due Date

Price Required

Lead Time
Required

Evaluation Type

Memo

Goods Line

No

6

BATON ROUGE SEWER & DRAIN INC - Roto Rooter (SPL-00698
Disposal Cost for Grease Removal Associated with Pumping
Maintenance - Land, Building, Structures (5C0009)

180,000.00

Gallon

$0.4900

$88,200.00

No

No

ET_All_Or_None

LSl | P






